
Garlichill Road, Epsom



Offers In Excess Of

£775,000

• No chain

• Detached bungalow

• Two double bedrooms

• Spacious living room

• 23ft dining room

• Kitchen leading to utility

• Modern four piece bathroom

• Over 100ft South Easterly rear garden

• Large driveway with parking

• Garage

Freehold

Coming to market with no chain and enjoying a slightly
elevated plot and located in a highly desirable road on
the periphery of the world famous Epsom Downs, is
this well presented and cleverly extended detached
home that offers incredibly flexible and generous
accommodation.

The wonderful welcoming feel, with it's flexible layout
is immediately apparent as soon as you step through
the door, with stylish and timeless touches, in short, this
fine home warrants immediate inspection to fully
appreciate everything it has to offer, including
potential to substantially extend to the side, rear and
loft if required (subject to the usual planning consent).

Properties of this style and calibre, in such a
convenient position as this are rarely available and
because of this we are recommending immediate
inspection.

The internal layout reveals well balanced space that
can suit a multitude of buyers, so whether you are
looking for more space than you already have,
considering an extension project to create your dream
home or perhaps wanting to downsize but not
downgrade or compromise, this immaculately
presented home can deliver on every level.

The property enjoys two well balanced, bay fronted
bedrooms, living room that leads onto the rear dining
space with views out onto the vast garden, modern
kitchen with integrated appliances, utility space and a
modern four piece bathroom. 

This fine detached bungalow is completed by a
frontage providing ample parking, 16ft garage and a
mature South Easterly facing, 100ft garden with patio
area perfect for relaxing with a glass of wine in the
warmer months, and ample outbuildings for storage.

Homes on Garlichill Road are always popular,
especially one as handsome as this. Located within
easy reach of local schools, local amenities and the
picturesque open spaces of Epsom Downs. Tattenham
Corner station is just a few minutes walk away whilst
the town of Epsom and Banstead Village are located
close by and offer comprehensive shopping and
leisure facilities, and transport links too.

Tenure - Freehold
Council tax band - E










